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Strictly NO unauthorised disclosure Dispose of as 'Confidential Waste' 

On 25/05/2014 at 23:21 hrs Police were called to UNIT 5 ST GEORGE’S 
INDUSTRIAL  ESTATE WHITE HART LANE N17 by the security guard at the 
venue stating suspects; were on premises.
Police attended the venue and a large group of approx. 20 young males and 
females, between 18-35 years of age and of mixed origins ran out the rear of 
the industrial estate through an alleyway leading to THETFORD CLOSE N13. 
Several males were still inside the premises claiming to be squatters. The 
remote viewing CCTV at the venue was contacted and stated that the alarms 
had just been activated and it had footage of several suspects causing damage 
to the security cameras and door locks at the venue upon entering the 
premises.
After several minutes and upon hearing Police organising entry to the premises 
in order to search for the suspects concerned in Criminal Damage the remaining 
occupants ran out of the rear doors to the venue. The front shutter then opened 
and a WHITE FORD  TRANSIT VEHICLE VRM CX52JPZ attempted to exit the 
premises. The driver an IC3 Male gave the particulars of Simon CORDELL DOB 
26/01/1981 of 109 BURNCROFT AVENUE EN3. PNCID 97/99378V. CORDELL 
stated he had just attended the venue to give his friends some food as they 
were squatting. The rear of the TRANSIT VAN contained a set of large 
speakers and music equipment but CORDELL insisted he used the equipment 
for festival work and was not setting up for a 'Rave'. CORDELL produced  
insurance documents but due to the day/hour officers were unable to verify 
details. CORDELL did not match the description of the IC1 Male suspects and 
was advised to leave the venue.
Security guards remained at the premises in order to secure them. Several 
young males and females continued to arrive at the venue dressed in 'suitable 
evening attire' for a : Rave and then promptly left upon seeing Police.


	Restricted
	Information




