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about:blank 1/2

Subject: Re: Invoice for Lock too Lock Festival

From: Omar Lawrence (omar.niburumedia@gmail.com)

To: re_wired@ymail.com;

Date: Tuesday, 17 September 2013, 14:50

Hi Simon,
please find attached a new invoice with some changes..

Thx.
O

On Tue, Sep 17, 2013 at 9:43 AM, Rewired Rewired <re_wired@ymail.com> wrote:
Hi Omar
 
I have redone the invoice for you.
 
Many Thanks
 
Simon
 
 
 

From: Omar Lawrence <omar.niburumedia@gmail.com>
To: Rewired Rewired <re_wired@ymail.com> 
Sent: Monday, 16 September 2013, 17:29
Subject: Re: Invoice for Lock too Lock Festival
 
Hi Simon,
Please address invoice to:
NIBURU MEDIA
ENFIELD ENTERPRISE CENTRE
26-28 QUEENSWAY
PONDERS END
EN3 4SA
 
Thanks.
Omar.
 
 
 
On Monday, September 16, 2013, Rewired Rewired wrote:

Hi Omar
 
Here is the invoice you have asked for.
 
Many Thanks
 
Simon 
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