7/30/2017

Subject: Re: Lock2Lock Invoice
From: Rewired Rewired (re_wired@ymail.com)
To: omar.niburumedia@gmail.com;

Friday, 27 September 2013, 17:25

Hi Omar
can you pay it into my mums account please info below

Barclays Bank

Miss Lorraine Cordell
20-29-77

80717177

Simon

From: Omar Lawrence <omar.niburumedia@gmail.com>
To: Rewired Rewired <re_wired@ymail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2013, 18:13

Subject: Re: Lock2Lock Invoice

Hi St'
Got meeting tomoro and so will update you then..

Thx.
0.

On Tue, Sep 24, 2013 at 1:22 PM, Rewired Rewired <re wired@ymail.com> wrote:
Hi Omar

Is there any update as to when the invoice can be paid?

Simon

From: Omar Lawrence <omar.niburumedia@gmail.com>
To: too smooth <re_wired@ymail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September 2013, 15:06

Subject: re: Lock2Lock Invoice

EZ Si'
please find attached a copy of the invoice, check it over and make sure you are kool with it..

OMAR LAWRENCE
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