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In the full search for the true incident of occurrences that really happened on 
this night: a person will find out that this is what really occurred; 
On this night we were latter to understand what had happened the reason 
being is:- my mother made a phone call to the police, this was once me and 
my friend had got of the phone to her, she done this so that she could 
understand what had truly happened and why it had, It got explained to her 
after calling the emergency 999 number from her mobile phone, that police 
officers had attended my home address earlier, the reason that them officer 
had done this got said to have been because they claimed to have received a 
phone call from myself earlier in the day, to which I dispute as this was not 
true. 
The police officers who had said that they had come to my house were the 
officers who had latter pulled me over with my friend and were the same 
officer to then latter update an Anti Social Behaviour Order application with 
this incident. 
When we got pulled over on this incident we got stopped, we got searched 
and after the event, we got let to go free pretty soon after, this problem 
occurred with the police alongside a roadside and this road was the same as 
any other road, it had adjoining roads that lead to other destinations, on this 
occasion some roads leading of the road to where we all got pulled over, was 
towards industrial estates, to which my Anti Social Behaviour Order 
 conditions will condemn me to prison for, if ever found guilty and would 
mean up to the time period of five years in prison and if this was to happen, 
then it would also mean, that I would gain a mark on my criminal record, as 
an Anti Social Behaviour Order is not a criminal offence on its own, but 
once found guilty for what it probates, the Anti Social Behaviour Order 
 conditions of any proven breach do become a criminal offence. At present, I 
do not have a criminal record that I have to declare to any person, as they 
were minor offences when I was a young man known as “Time Spent.” 
When I and my friend finally reached to my mother’s house we both decided 
to stay and sleep there over the night and have something to eat and done so, 
in the morning my friend left to his own house. 
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Chapter 43546 
 

24 hour assault of Cruel un-human treatment:- 
 
A few weeks passed by and I was still being victimised by the all ready 
mentioned. 
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